
Y9 Business Studies EDUQAS GCSE 

 

Term  AUTUMN Y10 Module Homework Activities 

External Influences 
1st half term 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
External Influences (Cont) 
2nd half term 

Introduction to Business 
 
Business Objectives  
The competitive environment 
Identifying opportunities 
Interdependence 
 
Factors of production 
 
Goods and Services 
 
The distinction between goods 
and services, 
 consumer durables 
single use 
personal services  
commercial services  
 
Public and Private Sectors 
 
Types of goods and services 
provided by each 
 
 
Entrepreneurship 
 
Characteristics 
Motives for being 
Risks and Rewards 
 
Business Plans 
 
Importance of 
Role of 
Sections of 
 
SMART targets 
 
Stakeholder Theory 
 
Business Organisation 
 
Sole Traders 

Homework will be set once a 
week for a brief exercise or 
once a fortnight with either 2 
sub tasks or one large task. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

Spring Term (1ST half) 
 
 
 

Partnerships 
LTD’s 
PLC’s 
 
Cooperatives and Charities 
 
Franchising 
 
Most appropriate business type 
in different contexts 
 
Dragons Den  / Enterprise 
Activity 

Homework will be set once a 
week for a brief exercise or 
once a fortnight with either 2 
sub tasks or one large task. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Spring Term 2ND half  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Summer Term  1ST Half 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Dragons Den . Enterprise 
continued 
 
Business Growth 
 
Methods Internal and external 
Why some businesses remain 
small 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Business Location  
 
Region 
Siting 
 
Business Enterprise activities 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Summer term 2ND half Y9  
 
 
 
 
 
 

Business Enterprise Activities 
 
Exercises exploring analytical 
techniques 
 
Percentages 
Percentage change 
Averages 
 
Revision activates 
 
Development of longer answer 
writing techniques 
 
 

Homework will be set once a 
week for a brief exercise or 
once a fortnight with either 2 
sub tasks or one large task. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 


